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A rapid narrative review,
summarising evidence on

what 'good' domiciliary
care is (along with

barriers and facilitators )
for key stakeholder

groups, will inform app
co-design. 

Key stakeholder groups
are people living with
dementia who receive
domiciliary care input,

their family/friends,
domiciliary care workers

and managers.

8 focus groups of  5-8
people each, covering all
stakeholder groups, will

also inform digital
platform co-design.

Focus groups will discuss
the needs, preferences

and barriers around
domiciliary care from

each stakeholder
perspective, which will

inform guiding principles
to apply in developing the

new platform.

WP1 and WP2 will inform
the digital platform co-

design process with
people living at home
with dementia, their
families/friends, and
domiciliary care staff

(including care workers
and managers). These
groups will inform the

content and interface of
the digital platform, and
in turn the variables for

algorithmic
computations.

Iterative development of
the computational

elements of the digital
platform along with web-

development of the
platform interface. 

WP3 and W4 are
intrinsically related, with

WP3 co-design groups
influencing all

steps/phases of digital
platform development
and iterative review. 

Health economics is a
cross cutting work

package.

Understanding the
indicators of value, the

needs of commissioners,
as well as intersectoral
costs and outcomes will

build the foundations of a
future full economic

evaluation of the
platform. Opportunities
to explore these issues

will be integrated within
the other work packages.
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